
Buyer:  Brenda Sensibaugh 6453 OF
Department of Transportation

Revised Bid Tab

Opening Date: 03/08/21

Li
ne

 #

Description Qty UOM  Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price

1 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 105 MP 28 WEST SIDE 1400 CY 74.71$       $           104,594.00 68.00$       $ 95,200.00 
2 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 136 MP 209 SOUTH SIDE 1000 CY 74.71$       $             74,710.00 68.00$       $ 68,000.00 
3 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 66 MP 79/92 875 CY 70.18$       $             61,407.50 70.13$       $ 61,363.75 
4 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 EAST JCT. OF 79/92 1125 CY 70.18$       $             78,952.50 72.95$       $ 82,068.75 
5 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 WAHOO MAINTENANCE YARD 830 CY 70.18$       $             58,249.40 72.75$       $ 60,382.50 
6 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 JCT OF HWY 15/64 975 CY 67.91$       $             66,212.25 73.10$       $ 71,272.50 
7 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 66 MP 79.8 1000 CY 67.91$       $             67,910.00 72.50$       $ 72,500.00 
8 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 #103 MP 49.84 2500 CY 67.91$       $           169,775.00 72.75$       $            181,875.00 
9 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 15 MP 155.54 LT SIDE 3826 CY 72.33$       $           276,734.58 No Bid
10 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 9 & 35 JCT MP 30.29 LT SID 1701 CY 74.33$       $           126,435.33 No Bid
11 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 9  MP 28.11 LT SID 1117 CY 73.75$       $             82,378.75 No Bid
12 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 35 MP 24.40 1835 CY 72.92$       $           133,808.20 No Bid
13 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 81 MP 180.04 1885 CY 73.29$       $           138,151.65 No Bid
14 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 LAUREL YARD HWY 20 MP 392.23 2159 CY 74.12$       $           160,025.08 No Bid
15 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 81 MP 202.04 LT SIDE 3034 CY 74.61$       $           226,366.74 No Bid
16 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 84 MP 34.03 RT SIDE 1290 CY 74.56$       $             96,182.40 No Bid
17 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 77 RP 167 2 S. WINNEBAGO 2400 CY 74.94$       $           179,856.00 No Bid
18 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 9 MP 10 WEST SIDE 3200 CY 74.33$       $           237,856.00 No Bid
19 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 15 MP 147.6 EAST SIDE 2400 CY 72.33$       $           173,592.00 No Bid
20 D-3 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 81 MP 180 EAST SIDE 2200 CY 73.29$       $           161,238.00 No Bid
21 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 STRANG MAINT. YARD 81/74 E JCT 2000 CY 68.67$       $           137,340.00 67.96$       $            135,920.00 
22 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 MP 256.2 NORTH SIDE HWY 6 1200 CY 67.91$       $             81,492.00 69.12$       $ 82,944.00 
23 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 81/34 EAST JCT SE CORNER 600 CY  $     67.15  $             40,290.00 68.50$       $ 41,100.00 
24 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 CENTRAL CITY 6200 CY 67.15$       $           416,330.00 No Bid
25 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 FULLERTON 2000 CY 67.91$       $           135,820.00 No Bid
26 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ORD HWY NE 70 MP 128 2100 CY  $     65.64  $           137,844.00 No Bid
27 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ST. PAUL YARD 3000 CY 67.15$       $           201,450.00 No Bid
28 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 GREELEY YARD 1400 CY 68.67$       $             96,138.00 No Bid
29 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 LEXINGTON YARD 3000 CY 70.73$       $           212,190.00 No Bid
30 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 SUTHERLAND HWY 25 MP 103 2000 CY 67.70$       $           135,400.00 No Bid
31 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 OGALLALA YARD 2500 CY 66.19$       $           165,475.00 No Bid
32 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ARTHUR HWY 61 MP 126 2500 CY 70.73$       $           176,825.00 No Bid
33 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ARTHUR HWY 61 MP 136.6 1500 CY 70.73$       $           106,095.00 No Bid
34 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HYANNIS HWY 2 MP 144 2000 CY 72.24$       $           144,480.00 No Bid
35 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 STAPLETON HWY 92 MP 225 2300 CY 72.74$       $           167,302.00 No Bid
36 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 BROKEN BOW WEST HWY 2 MP277 1000 CY 73.75$       $             73,750.00 No Bid
37 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 OCONTO MAINT YARD 1000 CY 73.75$       $             73,750.00 No Bid
38 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ANSLEY HWY 183 MP 89 1000 CY 73.75$       $             73,750.00 No Bid
39 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ARNOLD HWY 92 MP 251 1500 CY 70.73$       $           106,095.00 No Bid
40 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 MERNA WEST HWY 92 MP 269.3 1000 CY 73.75$       $             73,750.00 No Bid
41 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 ANSELMO HWY 2 MP 257.3 1000 CY 73.75$       $             73,750.00 No Bid
42 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 6 RP 182 EAST END MINDEN 1600 CY 70.73$       $           113,168.00 No Bid
43 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 23 RP 131.6 W END ELWOOD 1400 CY 70.73$       $             99,022.00 No Bid
44 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 10 RP 23.60 1500 CY 71.48$       $           107,220.00 No Bid

45
D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 23 RP 120.5 W END EUSTIS 1700

CY
70.73$      

 $           120,241.00 
No Bid

46 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 136 MP 40 E OF REPUBLICAN 800 CY 70.73$       $             56,584.00 No Bid
47 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY136 RP 61.49 W RIVERTON N S 1700 CY 71.48$       $           121,516.00 No Bid
48 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 23 RP 35.7 W OF ELSIE 2400 CY 68.46$       $           164,304.00 No Bid
49 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 25 RP 37.5/HAYES CENTER 2000 CY 69.22$       $           138,440.00 No Bid
50 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 6 RP 89/1.3MIL E OF MCCOOK 1600 CY 69.22$       $           110,752.00 No Bid
51 D-7 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X #8 HWY 34 RP30.3 W OF BENKELMAN 1000 CY 67.70$       $             67,700.00 No Bid
52 D-1 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 HWY 50 MP 18.59 700 CY 76.78$       $             53,746.00 67.25$       $ 47,075.00 
53 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 445 I-80 MP 285 GIBBON SW CRNR 2000 CY 65.64$       $           131,280.00 No Bid
54 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 441 HWY 40 MP 77 N. SIDE 1200 CY 66.40$       $             79,680.00 No Bid
55 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 444 HWY 10 MP 83.25 EASTSIDE 1400 CY 67.91$       $             95,074.00 No Bid
56 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 442 I-80 MP 305 NE CORNER ALDA 800 CY 67.15$       $             53,720.00 No Bid
57 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 MP 256.2 NORTH SIDE HWY 6 700 CY 67.91$       $             47,537.00 69.12$       $ 48,384.00 
58 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 451-HWY 14 MP 46 18 S OF AUROR 1750 CY 66.40$       $           116,200.00 No Bid
59 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 451-HWY 6 MP219 6 E OF HASTING 300 CY 67.15$       $             20,145.00 No Bid
60 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 451-HWY 14 MP 29 2400 CY 67.91$       $           162,984.00 71.63$       $            171,912.00 
61 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 452-HWY 14 MP 7.5 2900 CY 70.18$       $           203,522.00 68.44$       $            198,476.00 
62 D-4 EXPANDED SHALE 3/4 X 3/8 454-HWY 14 MP 61 1500 CY 66.40$       $             99,600.00 69.83$       $            104,745.00 
63 D-6 EXPANDED SHALE ¾ X # 8 1ML S OF I80 MM 248 4000 CY 70.18$       $           280,720.00 No Bid

 $        7,946,906.38  $         1,523,218.50 Total
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